June 2009 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $27,000.00 $0.00
2 0 NO BID $18,750.00 $0.00
3 0 NO BID $28,150.00 $0.00
4 0 NO BID $80,000.00 $0.00
5 136 Ronald Truscott $30,000.00 $41,000.00
6 136 Ronald Truscott $38,000.00 $79,000.00
7 0 NO BID $25,000.00 $0.00
8 0 NO BID $30,000.00 $0.00
9 109 Jonathan Swanson $36,000.00 $41,000.00
10 0 NO BID $24,000.00 $0.00
11 0 NO BID $8,000.00 $0.00
12 0 NO BID $25,600.00 $0.00
13 102 Hugo E Hietapelto, Jr $5,000.00 $5,000.00
14 132 Sicard Du Lac, LLC %John Signorelli $83,500.00 $84,000.00
15 0 NO BID $56,000.00 $0.00
16 0 NO BID $28,900.00 $0.00
17 0 NO BID $17,200.00 $0.00
18 0 NO BID $20,640.00 $0.00
19 0 NO BID $5,100.00 $0.00
20 113 Steven Verbick $8,500.00 $13,000.00
21 0 NO BID $21,650.00 $0.00
22 0 NO BID $3,000.00 $0.00
23 0 NO BID $4,600.00 $0.00
24 108 Louis Janezich and Andrea Janezich $3,750.00 $12,500.00
25 126 Greg Lindberg and Pam Lindberg $15,600.00 $19,500.00
26 0 NO BID $92,700.00 $0.00
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27 107 John Knight $26,000.00 $35,000.00
28 122 Lawrence A Reedy and Penny M Reedy $36,200.00 $36,200.00
29 133 Shawn Halverson $2,050.00 $2,050.00
30 0 NO BID $22,950.00 $0.00
Total Tracts 30 Total Value $823,840.00

Pulled Tracts 0 Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Available Tracts 30 Net Total Value $823,840.00 $368,250.00
Total Tracts Sold 1

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 36.67% Percent of Appraised Value Sold 44.70%
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