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Purchaser
James Prest
No Bid
Lori Huffman & Brad O. Huffman
Jeff McCulloch
Bryan Black
Theodore Shogren
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Daniel Sydow & Luke Sydow
No Bid
Doug Sage
No Bid
No Bid
Richard Carter & Heather Carter
Jeffrey Anderson
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
No Bid
Daniel Gunderson & Melanie Gunders(
No Bid
Kevin Lund
Robin Halmet & Roger Bontems
David A Stewart, David C Stewart & W
PULLED
Raymond Sogard
John Knight
David Clement & Ann Clement
John Knight
No Bid
Ward Poppenberg
Sandra Pearson
PULLED
Michael Pavich & Jamie Pavich
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Appraised Value

$12,200.00
$15,000.00
$8,500.00
$27,200.00
$27,200.00
$9,750.00
$21,500.00
$8,675.00
$25,500.00
$269,900.00
$97,500.00
$27,100.00
$11,700.00
$25,600.00
$87,500.00
$78,500.00
$31,250.00
$30,750.00
$82,300.00
$43,000.00
$17,600.00
$12,800.00
$2,000.00
$31,600.00
$112,000.00
$21,220.00
$112,000.00
$12,300.00
$42,000.00
$16,260.00
$0.00
$14,000.00
$8,000.00
$50,000.00
$9,700.00
$23,100.00
$19,000.00
$22,680.00
$0.00
$7,200.00

Sold Value

$12,200.00
$0.00
$8,500.00
$39,500.00
$27,200.00
$9,750.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$133,000.00
$0.00
$11,700.00
$0.00
$0.00
$102,000.00
$31,250.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$24,200.00
$0.00
$12,300.00
$63,000.00
$28,000.00
$0.00
$14,000.00
$15,000.00
$50,000.00
$13,100.00
$0.00
$27,000.00
$22,800.00
$0.00
$7,200.00



