February 2010 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $72,000.00 $0.00
2 0 NO BID $21,000.00 $0.00
3 0 NO BID $6,100.00 $0.00
4 0 NO BID $17,850.00 $0.00
5 114 Rare-Rock Investments, LLC $34,000.00 $34,000.00
6 0 NO BID $20,500.00 $0.00
7 108 Michael L Gralewski and Denise J Melchior $27,650.00 $27,650.00
8 0 NO BID $18,000.00 $0.00
9 109 Lance Parthe and Patricia Stoll $16,000.00 $16,000.00
10 999 PULLED $7,500.00 $0.00
11 111 Northern Communitie Land Trust $12,000.00 $16,000.00
12 0 NO BID $4,000.00 $0.00
13 0 NO BID $18,500.00 $0.00
14 0 NO BID $57,600.00 $0.00
15 0 NO BID $30,000.00 $0.00
16 0 NO BID $13,000.00 $0.00
17 0 NO BID $11,700.00 $0.00
18 0 NO BID $45,000.00 $0.00
19 105 Wayne A Edwards and Wavie L Edwards $22,600.00 $22,600.00
20 0 NO BID $72,000.00 $0.00
21 0 NO BID $53,400.00 $0.00
22 0 NO BID $46,000.00 $0.00
23 116 Francis Dreawves and Michael Dreawves $20,450.00 $20,450.00
24 0 NO BID $12,750.00 $0.00
25 0 NO BID $25,400.00 $0.00
26 0 NO BID $5,800.00 $0.00
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27 0 NO BID $36,000.00 $0.00
28 0 NO BID $20,700.00 $0.00
29 0 NO BID $30,000.00 $0.00
30 125 Thomas Stephen Nemanich $5,400.00 $5,400.00
31 125 Thomas Stephen Nemanich $5,600.00 $9,500.00
32 0 NO BID $2,000.00 $0.00
33 0 NO BID $1,950.00 $0.00
34 0 NO BID $47,700.00 $0.00
35 124 David Rogotzke and Anne Rogotzke $1,350.00 $1,350.00
36 0 NO BID $1,350.00 $0.00
Total Tracts 36 Total Value $842,850.00

Pulled Tracts 1 Pulled Tracts Value  $15,000.00

Net Available Tracts 35 Net Total Value $827,850.00 $152,950.00
Total Tracts Sold 9

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 25.711%

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 18.48%
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