
Compacted Solid Waste Roll-Off Container 
Haulage Service Cotton, County 77, French, Lavell, Orr 

Portage, and Soudan Canister Sites - Bid No. 4955 
Tab Sheet 

Opening May 3, 2011   2:00 PM 

    Bids Opened By:              /s/Donna Viskoe                 In Presence Of:               /s/ Life Verlooy  

      * Decided by Coin Toss 
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Northern MN Recycling 
  Virginia MN  5084115467 Y $ 3,315.00 $ 5,460.00 $ 6,630.00 $ 7,000.00 *$ 10,140.00 $ 45.00/HR $ 3,290.00 $ 2,610.00 $ 45.00/HR 

Waste Management 
  Duluth MN Y  Y *$ 3,315.00 $ 6,580.00 $ 6,460.00 $ 6,040.00 $ 10,140.00 $ 45.00/HR $ 3,360.00 $ No Bid $ 80.00/HR 

Udovich Garbage 
Gheen MN  57912 Y $ No Bid $ 6,860.00 $ No Bid $ No Bid $ 15,600.00 $ 65.00/HR $ 3,430.00 $ 2,925.00 $ 65.00/HR 

             

             

             

             

             


