February 2010 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $72,000.00 $0.00
2 0 NO BID $21,000.00 $0.00
3 0 NO BID $6,100.00 $0.00
4 0 NO BID $17,850.00 $0.00
5 114 Rare-Rock Investments, LLC $34,000.00 $34,000.00
6 0 NO BID $20,500.00 $0.00
7 108 Michael L Gralewski and Denise J Melchior $27,650.00 $27,650.00
8 0 NO BID $18,000.00 $0.00
9 109 Lance Parthe and Patricia Stoll $16,000.00 $16,000.00
10 999 PULLED $7,500.00 $0.00
11 111 Northern Communitie Land Trust $12,000.00 $16,000.00
12 0 NO BID $4,000.00 $0.00
13 0 NO BID $18,500.00 $0.00
14 0 NO BID $57,600.00 $0.00
15 0 NO BID $30,000.00 $0.00
16 0 NO BID $13,000.00 $0.00
17 0 NO BID $11,700.00 $0.00
18 0 NO BID $45,000.00 $0.00
19 105 Wayne A Edwards and Wavie L Edwards $22,600.00 $22,600.00
20 0 NO BID $72,000.00 $0.00
21 0 NO BID $53,400.00 $0.00
22 0 NO BID $46,000.00 $0.00
23 116 Francis Dreawves and Michael Dreawves $20,450.00 $20,450.00
24 0 NO BID $12,750.00 $0.00
25 0 NO BID $25,400.00 $0.00
26 0 NO BID $5,800.00 $0.00
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Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
27 0 NO BID $36,000.00 $0.00
28 0 NO BID $20,700.00 $0.00
29 0 NO BID $30,000.00 $0.00
30 125 Thomas Stephen Nemanich $5,400.00 $5,400.00
31 125 Thomas Stephen Nemanich $5,600.00 $9,500.00
32 0 NO BID $2,000.00 $0.00
33 0 NO BID $1,950.00 $0.00
34 0 NO BID $47,700.00 $0.00
35 124 David Rogotzke and Anne Rogotzke $1,350.00 $1,350.00
36 0 NO BID $1,350.00 $0.00
Total Tracts 36 Total Value $842,850.00

Pulled Tracts 1 Pulled Tracts Value  $15,000.00

Net Available Tracts 35 Net Total Value $827,850.00 $152,950.00
Total Tracts Sold 9

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 25.711%

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 18.48%
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June 2010 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $22,000.00 $0.00
2 102 Reed Blazevic and Mistica Blazevic $61,000.00 $61,000.00
3 110 Jack H Cadotte $2,100.00 $2,100.00
4 0 NO BID $60,000.00 $0.00
5 108 David S Nelson and Lori A Nelson $54,000.00 $54,000.00
6 0 NO BID $7,500.00 $0.00
7 999 PULLED $14,500.00 $0.00
8 999 PULLED $4,809.27 $0.00
9 0 NO BID $10,000.00 $0.00
10 0 NO BID $14,000.00 $0.00
11 999 PULLED $36,250.00 $0.00
12 0 NO BID $16,750.00 $0.00
13 109 Bruce Hollman $10,900.00 $15,000.00
14 0 NO BID $8,000.00 $0.00
15 103 Gregory R Wessels $33,170.00 $33,170.00
16 0 NO BID $20,000.00 $0.00
17 0 NO BID $23,870.00 $0.00
18 0 NO BID $40,000.00 $0.00
19 111 Rose Wilson and Julie Pappas $1,350.00 $1,350.00
20 0 NO BID $47,700.00 $0.00
21 112 Dan Gheorghita $2,000.00 $2,000.00
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Tract Number Bidder Name

Appraised Price Sale Amount

Total Tracts

Pulled Tracts

Net Available Tracts
Total Tracts Sold

Percent of Available Tracts Sold

21

3

18

7

38.89%

Total Value $489,899.27
Pulled Tracts Value $111,118.54

Net Total Value $378,780.73 $168,620.00

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 44.52%
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October 2010 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $49,900.00 $0.00
2 999 PULLED $9,000.00 $0.00
3 0 NO BID $62,000.00 $0.00
4 109 Seth Maxim $25,000.00 $25,000.00
5 117 Michelle Holmes $8,100.00 $10,250.00
6 105 Daryl Harper and Linda Harper $11,500.00 $11,500.00
7 104 Brandon Myrum $14,500.00 $17,500.00
8 116 Eric Westin $7,500.00 $8,750.00
9 115 Russell Blake and Arlene Blake $4,500.00 $4,500.00
10 0 NO BID $3,700.00 $0.00
11 101 Chad Rutherford and Jessie Rutherford $28,500.00 $31,500.00
12 122 Timothy Ronchetti $12,800.00 $12,800.00
13 0 NO BID $2,200.00 $0.00
14 0 NO BID $69,000.00 $0.00
15 0 NO BID $7,000.00 $0.00
16 0 NO BID $14,400.00 $0.00
17 0 NO BID $33,200.00 $0.00
18 0 NO BID $14,000.00 $0.00
19 118 David Grimm $28,000.00 $31,000.00
20 0 NO BID $20,500.00 $0.00
21 111 Kenneth Kiefat $8,200.00 $8,200.00
22 0 NO BID $14,900.00 $0.00
23 0 NO BID $17,900.00 $0.00
24 0 NO BID $950.00 $0.00
25 0 NO BID $650.00 $0.00
26 0 NO BID $650.00 $0.00
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Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
27 0 NO BID $2,000.00 $0.00
28 0 NO BID $3,000.00 $0.00
29 102 Steven B. Filipovich $1,725.00 $1,725.00
30 124 Scott Morcom $525.00 $525.00
31 0 NO BID $525.00 $0.00
32 119 James Boldrey $1,020.00 $1,020.00
33 124 Scott Morcom $525.00 $525.00
34 0 NO BID $360.00 $0.00
35 0 NO BID $660.00 $0.00
36 0 NO BID $330.00 $0.00
Total Tracts 36 Total Value $479,220.00

Pulled Tracts 1 Pulled Tracts Value  $27,000.00

Net Available Tracts 35 Net Total Value $452,220.00 $164,795.00
Total Tracts Sold 14

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 40.00%

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 36.44%
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