February 14th 2008 Land Sale Summary

Purchaser

No Bid

Paul Voeltz

No Bid

No Bid

Dennis Dagger
Michael Gibbons
No Bid

No Bid

Brian Palokangas
Brian Forsman
No Bid

Wesley Buck
Timothy Elg
Miles Nygaard
Gordon Oftedahl
No Bid

Carol Brown
Donald Zachow
PULLED
PULLED

Loren Witte
Dennis Dagger
Keith Olson

No Bid

Joseph Miller
Dan Lokken

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

PULLED

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Seth Peterson
Jody McCormick

Appraised Value

$71,800.00
$13,800.00
$60,000.00
$49,400.00
$12,000.00
$33,000.00
$36,800.00
$64,500.00
$5,500.00
$17,900.00
$16,500.00
$8,250.00
$4,750.00
$4,000.00
$7,700.00
$25,500.00
$14,000.00
$24,000.00
$3,600.00
$4,000.00
$28,000.00
$4,000.00
$16,700.00
$34,100.00
$59,550.00
$3,800.00
$6,500.00
$3,750.00
$4,050.00
$3,550.00
$5,800.00
$3,600.00
$3,325.00
$1,700.00
$4,379.70
$400.00
$150.00

Sold Value

$0.00
$13,800.00
$0.00
$0.00
$16,250.00
$46,000.00
$0.00
$0.00
$6,100.00
$17,900.00
$0.00
$8,250.00
$8,500.00
$7,800.00
$7,900.00
$0.00
$14,100.00
$24,200.00
$0.00
$0.00
$28,000.00
$4,950.00
$16,700.00
$0.00
$59,550.00
$11,800.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$0.00
$400.00
$600.00



June 2008 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $73,500.00 $0.00
2 103 Richard Robinson and Kathryn Kellner-Robinson $7,800.00 $7,800.00
3 0 NO BID $10,500.00 $0.00
4 0 NO BID $34,000.00 $0.00
5 102 Steve and Leah Walters $16,650.00 $16,650.00
6 0 NOBID $8,500.00 $0.00
7 999 PULLED $110,400.00 $0.00
8 0 NO BID $9,100.00 $0.00
9 0 NO BID $51,000.00 $0.00
10 0 NO BID $18,000.00 $0.00
11 131 Christopher Freeman $2,200.00 $4,000.00
12 131 Christopher Freeman $2,000.00 $4,200.00
13 128 Eldred Ingersoll $11,500.00 $11,500.00
14 116 John Godec $1,800.00 $2,400.00
16 110 Dennis Lindberg $5,000.00 $5,200.00
17 0 NO BID $6,300.00 $0.00
18 0 NO BID $9,500.00 $0.00
19 112 Lisa Carter $5,650.00 $5,650.00
20 113 Darwin Fossell and Jennifer Fossell $27,400.00 $27,400.00
21 136 Rich Ellenberger $18,500.00 $23,500.00
22 109 Lowell Grovum $26,000.00 $26,000.00
23 123 Scott A Espey and David A Espey $3,050.00 $3,050.00
24 999 PULLED $4,000.00 $0.00
25 999 PULLED $3,600.00 $0.00
26 0 NOBID $42,500.00 $0.00
27 0 NO BID $24,000.00 $0.00
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Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
28 0 NO BID $7,920.00 $0.00
29 108 Robert and Dianne Horn $4,650.00 $7,500.00
30 0 NO BID $90,000.00 $0.00
31 0 NO BID $1,100.00 $0.00
32 0 NOBID $2,000.00 $0.00
Total Tracts 31 Total Value $638,120.00
Pulled Tracts 3 Pulled Tracts Value $118,000.00
Net Available Tracts 28 Net Total Value $520,120.00 $144,850.00
Total Tracts Sold 13
Percent of Available 46.43% Percent of 27.85%
Tracts Sold Appraised Value
Sold
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October 2008 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 124 Donald Zachow and Elsie Zachow $8,000.00 $8,350.00
2 0 NO BID $45,000.00 $0.00
3 0 NO BID $24,500.00 $0.00
4 0 NO BID $70,000.00 $0.00
5 128 Velma Morton $39,500.00 $39,500.00
6 0 NO BID $13,650.00 $0.00
7 0 NO BID $39,500.00 $0.00
8 118 BACT Properties, LLC $6,500.00 $7,500.00
9 999 Pulled $18,500.00 $0.00
10 0 NO BID $38,700.00 $0.00
11 999 Pulled $22,000.00 $0.00
12 999 Pulled $5,100.00 $0.00
13 114 James Pehl $11,515.00 $11,515.00
14 134 Jeffrey L Hill $15,500.00 $15,500.00
15 0 NO BID $14,300.00 $0.00
16 117 James Ebnet and June Ebnet $12,800.00 $12,800.00
17 0 NO BID $49,800.00 $0.00
18 0 NO BID $30,500.00 $0.00
19 132 Thomas lwen $38,000.00 $38,000.00
20 108 Patricia L Heraly $16,000.00 $16,000.00
21 0 NO BID $1,550.00 $0.00
22 0 NO BID $3,300.00 $0.00
23 0 NO BID $17,200.00 $0.00
24 107 John Walkama $39,500.00 $39,500.00
25 0 NO BID $54,000.00 $0.00
26 0 NO BID $12,950.00 $0.00
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Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
27 0 NO BID $51,600.00 $0.00
28 130 Paige Bisbee $3,500.00 $5,700.00

Total Tracts

Pulled Tracts

Net Available Tracts
Total Tracts Sold

Percent of Available Tracts Sold

28

3

25

10

40.00%

Total Value $702,965.00

Pulled Tracts Value  $91,200.00
Net Total Value $611,765.00 $194,365.00

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 31.77%
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