February 2012 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $51,500.00

2 0 NO BID $7,350.00

3 117 Thomas Anderson $20,450.00 $36,000.00
4 0 NO BID $5,950.00

5 0 NO BID $13,125.00

6 0 NO BID $19,700.00

7 127 Ronald Salveson $6,350.00 $6,350.00
8 0 NO BID $12,600.00

9 0 NO BID $118,150.00

10 111 Ethan Lee Humphreys $22,000.00 $22,000.00
11 0 NO BID $17,500.00

12 0 NO BID $34,250.00

13 0 NO BID $36,800.00

14 103 Roy C Lepak $25,000.00 $46,000.00
15 124 Daniel Lundquist and Kelly Lundquist $7,900.00 $7,900.00
16 0 NO BID $25,500.00

17 0 NO BID $24,100.00

18 0 NO BID $25,650.00

19 0 NO BID $18,775.00

20 0 NO BID $16,150.00

21 126 Gregory Heinecke and Laurie Heinecke $26,000.00 $30,000.00
22 0 NO BID $14,400.00

23 0 NO BID $21,150.00

24 0 NO BID $24,500.00

25 0 NO BID $5,900.00

26 0 NO BID $17,950.00

Thursday, February 09, 2012 Page 1 of 2



Tract Number Bidder Name

Appraised Price

Sale Amount

27 0 NO BID

28 121

29 119 Jasen Cloutier
30 0 NO BID

31 104

32 0 NO BID

Total Tracts

Pulled Tracts

Net Available Tracts
Total Tracts Sold

Percent of Available Tracts Sold

Dean Talbott and Kevin Hagen

Scott Saltzman and lva Saltzman

32

0

32

9

28.13%

$9,700.00

$9,000.00

$4,000.00

$10,200.00

$13,600.00

$15,450.00

Total Value $680,650.00

Pulled Tracts Value $0.00

Net Total Value $680,650.00

$10,200.00

$4,000.00

$13,600.00

$176,050.00

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 25.86%
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