February 2011 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $52,000.00 $0.00
2 110 Kenneth Nelson and Marcia Nelson $32,000.00 $76,000.00
3 0 NO BID $57,750.00 $0.00
4 0 NO BID $23,500.00 $0.00
5 999 PULLED $4,500.00 $0.00
6 113 Ren'ee Dominguez $16,500.00 $16,500.00
7 0 NO BID $50,001.76 $0.00
8 0 NO BID $6,600.00 $0.00
9 0 NO BID $17,850.00 $0.00
10 101 Sean Kempke $36,250.00 $36,250.00
11 118 David Kromer and Diane Kromer $5,000.00 $16,000.00
12 102 J Michael Bowers and Mary Kay Bowers $16,750.00 $16,750.00
13 0 NO BID $26,700.00 $0.00
14 0 NO BID $23,000.00 $0.00
15 0 NO BID $25,500.00 $0.00
16 116 Thomas Anderson $44,000.00 $78,000.00
17 0 NO BID $21,200.00 $0.00
18 0 NO BID $3,410.00 $0.00
19 0 NO BID $17,400.00 $0.00
20 0 NO BID $8,000.00 $0.00
21 0 NO BID $18,000.00 $0.00
22 0 NO BID $16,000.00 $0.00
23 0 NO BID $180.00 $0.00
24 0 NO BID $525.00 $0.00
25 0 NO BID $360.00 $0.00
26 0 NO BID $660.00 $0.00
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Tract Number Bidder Name

Appraised Price Sale Amount

27 0 NO BID
28 0 NO BID
29 0 NO BID
30 0 NO BID
31 0 NO BID
32 0 NO BID
33 0 NO BID
34 0 NO BID

Total Tracts

Pulled Tracts

Net Available Tracts
Total Tracts Sold

Percent of Available Tracts Sold

34

1

33

6

18.18%

$660.00 $0.00
$660.00 $0.00
$660.00 $0.00
$1,380.00 $0.00
$660.00 $0.00
$660.00 $0.00
$660.00 $0.00
$660.00 $0.00

Total Value $529,636.76

Pulled Tracts Value  $9,000.00
Net Total Value $520,636.76 $239,500.00

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 46.00%
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June 2011 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 0 NO BID $18,000.00

2 109 Michelle Holmes $12,000.00 $12,000.00
3 0 NOBID $31,000.00

4 102 Darin Lind and Sherri Lind $23,600.00 $23,600.00
5 0 NO BID $30,000.00

6 0 NO BID $26,000.00

7 105 Randy Schroetter $19,800.00 $19,800.00
8 999 PULLED $57,750.00

9 0 NO BID $47,000.00

10 999 PULLED $24,400.00

il 0 NO BID $3,000.00

12 0 NOBID $18,650.00

13 0 NOBID $33,000.00

14 0 NO BID $24,000.00

15 0 NOBID $37,800.00

16 0 NOBID $37,800.00

17 0 NOBID $360.00

18 0 NO BID $660.00

19 0 NOBID $660.00

20 0 NOBID $660.00

21 0 NOBID $660.00

22 103 Christopher S Cotton $660.00 $660.00
23 0 NO BID $660.00

24 0 NOBID $660.00
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Tract Number Bidder Name

Appraised Price Sale Amount

Total Tracts

Pulled Tracts

Net Available Tracts

Total Tracts Sold

Percent of Available Tracts Sold

Thursday, June 09, 2011

24

2

22

4
18.18%

Total Value $448,780.00
Pulled Tracts Value $246,450.00
Net Total Value $202,330.00 $56,060.00

Percent of Appraised Value Sold 27.71%
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October 2011 - AUCTION SUMMARY

Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount
1 123 Alysius Cismowski $34,000.00 $65,000.00
2 118 Hollee B Hembree and Steven S Brown and Kita L Rose $80,000.00 $108,000.00
3 0 NO BID $18,000.00 $0.00
4 0 NO BID $18,000.00 $0.00
5 0 NO BID $18,000.00 $0.00
6 125 Ronald Karels and Denise Karels $26,500.00 $28,000.00
7 0 NO BID $168,800.00 $0.00
8 999 PULLED $68,000.00 $0.00
9 0 NO BID $31,500.00 $0.00
10 108 Joshua J Friend and Angel M Mikulak $30,000.00 $37,000.00
11 111 Richard Schmid and Janice Schmid $5,500.00 $5,500.00
12 122 Brian Mickelson $3,375.00 $3,375.00
13 0 NO BID $8,700.00 $0.00
14 0 NO BID $46,800.00 $0.00
15 0 NO BID $20,000.00 $0.00
16 0 NO BID $12,100.00 $0.00
17 107 Michael Siemsen and Murray Siemsen $16,000.00 $16,000.00
18 113 Pelto Properties Inc $24,400.00 $24,400.00
19 0 NO BID $9,000.00 $0.00
20 0 NO BID $26,000.00 $0.00
21 121 Daniel L Line and Heather Line $33,000.00 $33,000.00
22 0 NO BID $9,500.00 $0.00
23 124 Craig Merten and Janet Merten $825.00 $825.00
24 0 NO BID $550.00 $0.00
25 0 NO BID $660.00 $0.00
26 124 Craig Merten and Janet Merten $825.00 $825.00
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Tract Number Bidder Name Appraised Price Sale Amount

27 0 NO BID $660.00 $0.00
28 0 NO BID $1,725.00 $0.00
29 0 NO BID $660.00 $0.00
30 0 NO BID $660.00 $0.00
31 0 NO BID $660.00 $0.00
32 0 NO BID $1,725.00 $0.00

Total Tracts 32 Total Value $716,125.00

Pulled Tracts 1 Pulled Tracts Value $136,000.00

Net Available Tracts 31 Net Total Value $580,125.00 $321,925.00

Total Tracts Sold 1

Percent of Available Tracts Sold 35.48% Percent of Appraised Value Sold 55.49%
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